BID TABULATION

BID OPENING DATE: August 14,2012

BID OPENING TIME: 3:00 p.m.

BID TITLE / DESCRIPTION: Kirkwood Park Consolidated Implementation Plan

BID NUMBER: 9254

PAGE__1__OF_3__

SIGNATURES:
COMPANY NAME Orf Construction The Harlan Co. John Kalicak Construction
CITY AND STATE Bridgeton, MO St. Louis, MO St. Louis, MO
X CONTACT David Orf John Harlan Nicholas Kruse
X PHONE 314-298-0770 314-890-2351 314-652-2355
X FAX
X EMAIL
VENDOR'S SIGNATURE
QTY UNIT |DESCRIPTION
1 ea |Base Proposal - Central Ridge - Phase 4 $568,000.00 $568,500.00 $571,111.00
1 ea |Base Proposal - Walker Lake - Phase 3 $560,000.00 $438,800.00 No Bid
1 ea |Base Proposal - Other Projects $197,000.00 $198,800.00 No Bid
1 ea [Central Ridge - Alternate # 1 - Sunami Shade Structure Installation No Bid $26,000.00 $30,968.00
1 ea |Central Ridge - Alternate # 2 - Plumbing Fixture Installation $5,700.00 $7,000.00 $7,700.00
1 ea |Central Ridge - Alternate # 3 - Concrete Curb at Tennis Court Lot $43,800.00 $25,000.00 $35,100.00
1 ea |Walker Lake - Alternate # 1 - Light Bollard Installation $34,600.00 $65,000.00 No Bid
1 ea [Walker Lake - Alternate # 2 - Landscape Planting Installation $52,700.00 $65,000.00 No Bid
1 ea |Walker Lake - Alternate # 3 - P.C.C. Pavement $37,200.00 $10,000.00 No Bid
1 ea [Other Projects - Alternate # 1 - Community Center Lot Improvements $195,000.00 $228,600.00 No Bid
1 ea |Other Projects - Alternate # 2 - Asphault at N. Community Center Entry $14,600.00 $14,500.00 No Bid
1 ea [Other Projects - Alternate # 3 - Asphault at Community Center Gym S. Lot $16,100.00 $16,000.00 No Bid
1 ea [Other Projects - Alternate # 4 - Asphault option Reim Theater Parking Lot ($52,600.00) ($45,000.00) No Bid
1 cy [Rock Excavation $275.00 $250.00 $275.00
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SIGNATURES:
COMPANY NAME C. Rallo Contracting Ideal Landscaping Landesign LLC.
CITY AND STATE St. Louis, MO St. Louis, MO Wentzville, MO 63385
X CONTACT Charles Rallo David Buckel George Tucker
X PHONE 314-664-2900 314-892-9500 636-332-4500
X FAX
X EMAIL
VENDOR'S SIGNATURE
QTY UNIT [DESCRIPTION
1 ea [Base Proposal - Central Ridge - Phase 4 633,000.00 569,077.00 635,000.00
1 ea [Base Proposal - Walker Lake - Phase 3 425,000.00 338,444.00 427,500.00
1 ea [Base Proposal - Other Projects 225,000.00 178,744.00 221,700.00
1 ea [Central Ridge - Alternate # 1 - Sunami Shade Structure Installation 26,000.00 30,974.00 27,146.00
1 ea [Central Ridge - Alternate # 2 - Plumbing Fixture Installation 9,000.00 10,500.00 7,208.00
1 ea [Central Ridge - Alternate # 3 - Concrete Curb at Tennis Court Lot 17,000.00 26,968.00 15,270.00
1 ea [Walker Lake - Alternate # 1 - Light Bollard Installation 36,000.00 24,222.00 36,330.00
1 ea [Walker Lake - Alternate # 2 - Landscape Planting Installation 75,000.00 67,895.00 42,150.00
1 ea |Walker Lake - Alternate # 3 - P.C.C. Pavement 1,500.00 10,000.00 14,700.00
1 ea [Other Projects - Alternate # 1 - Community Center Lot Improvements 235,000.00 212,888.00 199,000.00
1 ea |Other Projects - Alternate # 2 - Asphault at N. Community Center Entry 27,000.00 15,669.00 22,900.00
1 ea [Other Projects - Alternate # 3 - Asphault at Community Center Gym S. Lot 22,000.00 16,222.00 17,925.00
1 ea [Other Projects - Alternate # 4 - Asphault option Reim Theater Parking Lot (32,000.00) (30,000.00) (27,700.00)
1 cy |Rock Excavation 200.00 300.00 200.00
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SIGNATURES: Extended Pricing
COMPANY NAME The Harlan Co. Ideal Landscaping
CITY AND STATE St. Louis, MO St. Louis, MO
X CONTACT John Harlan David Buckel
X PHONE 314-890-2351 314-892-9500
X FAX
X EMAIL
VENDOR'S SIGNATURE
QTY UNIT [DESCRIPTION

1 ea [Base Proposal - Central Ridge - Phase 4 608,295.00 579,077.00

1 ea [Base Proposal - Walker Lake - Phase 3 469,516.00 338,777.00

1 ea [Base Proposal - Other Projects 212,716.00 178,744.00

1 ea [Central Ridge - Alternate # 1 - Sunami Shade Structure Installation 27,820.00 30,974.00

1 ea [Central Ridge - Alternate # 2 - Plumbing Fixture Installation 7,490.00 10,500.00

1 ea [Central Ridge - Alternate # 3 - Concrete Curb at Tennis Court Lot 26,750.00 26,968.00

1 ea [Walker Lake - Alternate # 1 - Light Bollard Installation 69,550.00 24,222.00

1 ea |[Walker Lake - Alternate # 2 - Landscape Planting Installation 69,550.00 67,895.00

1 ea |Walker Lake - Alternate # 3 - P.C.C. Pavement 10,700.00 10,000.00

1 ea [Other Projects - Alternate # 1 - Community Center Lot Improvements 244,600.00 222,888.00

1 ea |Other Projects - Alternate # 2 - Asphault at N. Community Center Entry 15,515.00 17,669.00

1 ea [Other Projects - Alternate # 3 - Asphault at Community Center Gym S. Lot 17,120.00 18,222.00

1 ea [Other Projects - Alternate # 4 - Asphault option Reim Theater Parking Lot (45,000.00) (25,000.00)

1 cy |Rock Excavation 250.00 300.00




