
Bid Date:

 *Price shown as per ea, usable qt., or usable gal. Bid Time:
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Signed: Signed:

City of Kirkwood
Purchasing Department

Bid Tabulation

Bid Commodity: Janitorial Supplies for Recreation October 20, 2011

Industrial Soap

Price

3M Strip Pad 20” Black 3M Niagra 7200N $3.27 ea 3M Niagra 7200N $3.27 ea ISC Envirotex $2.36 ea

2:30 PM

Bid Number: 8820

Bid Description
HP Option 1

Product Offered

HP Products

Option 1 Price

HP Option 2

Product Offered

HP Products

Option 2 Price

Industrial Soap

Product Offered

$2.36 ea

3M Polish Pad 20” 

White 3M Niagra 4100N $3.18 ea 3M Niagra 4100N $3.18 ea ISC Envirotex $2.36 ea

3M Buff Pad 20” Tan 3M 3500 $4.46 ea 3M 3500 $4.46 ea ISC Envirotex

$2.36 ea

Stay Free #4 (sanitary 

napkins) Hospeco $0.13 ea Hospeco $0.13 ea Stay Free #4 $0.09568 ea

3M Lt. Scrub Pad 20” 

Red 3M Niagra 5100N $3.18 ea 3M Niagra 5100N $3.18 ea ISC Envirotex

$0.0264 ea liner

Dust Mop Rubbermaid $14.70 ea Rubbermaid $14.70 ea

ISC Envirotex

5836-00000 $8.80  ea

Sanisac Liners (wax 

bags) Hospeco $0.03 ea liner Hospeco $0.03 ea liner

ISC 

#6472-0000

$2.53 ea

Linen Fresh Aerosol Claire $2.55 ea Claire $2.55 ea

Linen Fresh

#401244 $8.75 ea

Dust Mop Frame Rubbermaid $3.63 ea Rubbermaid $3.63 ea ISC Envirotex

$6.60 ea

Paper Towels (wht pull 

down) Kimberly Clark $6.99 ea (1000' Roll) Cascades $4.16 (1000' Roll)

ISC  

1068-5 $4.16 (1000' Roll)

Synthetic Blend Screw 

Mop Head 24 oz Rubbermaid $6.43 ea Rubbermaid $6.43 ea ISC Envirotex

8

9

10

11

Item

Number

1

2

3

4

5

6

7



Bid Date:

 *Price shown as per ea, case, usable qt., or usable gal. Bid Time:

Page: 2 of 6

Signed: Signed:

City of Kirkwood
Purchasing Department

Bid Tabulation

Bid Commodity: Janitorial Supplies for Recreation October 20, 2011

2:30 PM

Bid Number: 8820

Item

Number Bid Description
HP Option 1

Product Offered

HP Products

Option 1 Price

HP Option 2

Product Offered

HP Products

Option 2 Price

Industrial Soap

Product Offered

Industrial Soap

Price

12 Playtex Tampon Hospeco $0.17 ea Hospeco $0.17 ea Tampex Tampons $0.1104 ea

Gojo 

5161-03

$33.83 case, 

3/1250ml

14

Push Enzyme (drain 

maintainer)
Betco Push 

13312 $4.14 qt.

Spartan Consume

3197 $2.96 qt

ISC Bio-Treat 

2100 $0.049 qt.

13

Gojo Foam Hand 

Cleaner
Gojo 

5161 $40.09 case, 3/1250ml

Gojo

5161 $40.09 case, 3/1250ml

ISC

1597 $76.00 per 5 Gal pal

16 Easy Task (spray buff)
Betco East Task

60812 $3.41 qt.

Spartan Spray Buff

3040 $2.38 qt.

Spartan

3040 $29.00 per 12 qt. case

15

GT (gym tack wood flr 

cleaner)
Betco Wood Floor 

Cleaner      69505 $0.05 qt.

Spartan Aqua Sport

5837 $0.10 qt.

ISC Wax Buster

510 $38.00 per 5 Gal pal

18 Low Maint. Floor Finish
Betco Low Mant. 

Finish        69605 $4.13 qt.

Spartan Sealer / Finish             

350405 $3.86 qt.

ISC Steel Deck

1492 $39.24 per 5 Gal pal

17 Extreme Floor Stripper
Betco Extreme

18405 $4.51 qt.

Spartan Finish 

Remover          3505 $0.38 qt.

Glance RTD

3165337 $0.50 qt.

20

Green Earth Floor 

Cleaner (Green Seal)
Betco Green Earth

53647 $0.04 qt.

Spartan All Purpose 

Cleaner         351105 $0.08 qt.

Stride RTD

3063390 $0.07 qt.

19

Deep Blue (window 

cleaner) (Green Seal)
Betco Deep Blue

18137 $0.27 qt.

Spartan Glass Cleaner         

351202 $0.12 qt.

Virex II 256 RTD

3062768 $0.08 qt.

22

Deep Blue (window 

cleaner) (EPA) No Bid n/a

Spartan Glass Cleaner         

351302 $0.12 qt. No Bid n/a

21

Quat Stat Disinfectant 

(Green Seal) No Bid n/a

Spartan Neutral 

Disinfectant  351302 $0.07 qt.



Bid Date:

 *Price shown as per ea, usable qt., or usable gal. Bid Time:
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Signed: Signed:

City of Kirkwood
Purchasing Department

Bid Tabulation

Bid Commodity: Janitorial Supplies for Recreation October 20, 2011

2:30 PM

Bid Number: 8820

Item

Number Bid Description
HP Option 1

Product Offered

HP Products

Option 1 Price

HP Option 2

Product Offered

HP Products

Option 2 Price

Industrial Soap

Product Offered

Industrial Soap

Price

23

Green Earth Floor 

Cleaner (EPA) No Bid n/a

Spartan Neutral 

Disinfectant   351302 $0.07 qt. No Bid n/a

No Bid n/a

25

Deep Blue (window 

cleaner) (Hydrogen P)
Betco Peroxide

33647 $0.16 qt.

Spartan Clean by 

Peroxy             482002 $0.11 qt. No Bid n/a

24

Quat Stat Disinfectant 

(EPA)
Betco Quat

35037 $0.10 qt.

Spartan Neutral 

Disinfectant   351302 $0.07 qt.

No Bid n/a

27

Quat Stat Disinfectant 

(Hydrogen P)
Betco Oxyfect H

35747 $0.58 qt. Spartan           353604 $2.08 qt. No Bid n/a

26

Green Earth Floor 

Cleaner (Hydrogen P)
Betco Peroxide

33647 $0.78 qt.

Spartan Clean by 

Peroxy             482002 $0.11 qt.

Mixing Station Free

29

EPA Certified 

(Dispenser) Betco

Installed Dispenser 

Compatible

Clean on the Go 

Chemical Mixing 

Station Free No Bid n/a

28 Green Seal (Dispenser) Betco

Installed Dispenser 

Compatible

Clean on the Go 

Chemical Mixing 

Station Free

No Bid n/a30

Hydrogen Peroxide 

Based (Dispenser) Betco

Installed Dispenser 

Compatible

Clean on the Go 

Chemical Mixing 

Station Free



Bid Date:

 *Price shown as per ea, usable qt., or usable gal. Bid Time:
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Signed: Signed:

City of Kirkwood
Purchasing Department

Bid Tabulation

Bid Commodity: Janitorial Supplies for Recreation October 20, 2011

2:30 PM

Bid Number: 8820

Item

Number Bid Description
Hillyard

Product Offered

Hillyard

Price

Royal Papers

Product Offered

Royal Papers

Price

New System 

Product Offered

New System

Price

1 3M Strip Pad 20” Black Hillyard $2.78 ea Glit $2.77 ea Prolink $3.562 ea

Prolink $3.562 ea

3

3M Polish Pad 20” 

White Hillyard $2.78 ea Glit $2.77 ea Prolink $3.562 ea

2 3M Buff Pad 20” Tan Hillyard $2.78 ea Glit $2.95 ea

Prolink $3.562 ea

5

Stay Free #4 (sanitary 

napkins) Maxithins $0.13 ea Rochester $0.14 ea Stay Free $0.14548 ea

4

3M Lt. Scrub Pad 20” 

Red Hillyard $2.78 ea Glit $2.77 ea

Sanisac $0.03124 ea liner

7 Dust Mop Hillyard $7.11 ea Royal ab $10.53 ea Prolink $11.02 ea

6

Sanisac Liners (wax 

bags) Rubbermaid $0.09  ea liner Rochester $0.038 ea liner

Prolink $3.30 ea

9 Linen Fresh Aerosol Rubbermaid $19.71 ea

TC 9000

Microburst $8.11 ea Rubbermaid $10.51 ea

8 Dust Mop Frame Hillyard $2.52 ea Royal ab $4.25 ea

Layflat $9.23 ea

11

Paper Towels (wht pull 

down) LIVI $3.79 (800' Roll) Tork $4.63 (800' Roll)

10

Synthetic Blend Screw 

Mop Head 24 oz Hillyard $3.99 ea Royal ab $5.18 ea



Bid Date:
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Signed: Signed:

City of Kirkwood
Purchasing Department

Bid Tabulation

Bid Commodity: Janitorial Supplies for Recreation October 20, 2011

2:30 PM

Bid Number: 8820

Item

Number Bid Description
Hillyard

Product Offered

Hillyard

Price

Royal Papers

Product Offered

Royal Papers

Price

New System 

Product Offered

New System

Price

12 Playtex Tampon Tampex $0.32 ea Rochester $0.104 ea Playtex $0.12518 ea

Betco

7562900

$7.50 per refill,

Refill = 1428 Pumps

14

Push Enzyme (drain 

maintainer)
Liquid Enzyme II

HIL0101404 $3.01 qt.

Spartan

Consume           3197 $2.38 qt.

Betco

1331200 $4.60 qt

13

Gojo Foam Hand 

Cleaner
Rubbermaid

TEC750386

$78.86 case, 

4/1600 ml

Spartan

Lite 'n Foamy     3308

$11.44 per Gal of 

Product

Betco

6950500 $0.70 qt.

16 Easy Task (spray buff)
Restorer

HIL0053904 $6.16 qt.

Spartan

Spray Buff           3040 $1.91 qt.

Betco

6081200 $0.7825 qt.

15

GT (gym tack wood flr 

cleaner)
Super Shine All

HIL0080822 $0.01 qt.

Spartan 

Wood Floor        5837 $0.028 qt.

Betco

1840500 $0.815 qt.

18 Low Maint. Floor Finish
Explorer

HIL0053407 $3.60 qt.

Spartan

Sunnyside          4045 $2.57 qt.

Betco

6440500 $6.7705 qt.

17 Extreme Floor Stripper
Super Strip

HIL0015247 $0.29 qt.

Spartan

Emalsifier Plus 0084 $0.235 qt.

Betco

1080400 $0.05 qt.

20

Green Earth Floor 

Cleaner (Green Seal) Suprox $0.02 qt.

Spartan

Tri Base              4830 $0.07 qt.

Betco

3360400 $0.0293 qt.

19

Deep Blue (window 

cleaner) (Green Seal)
Green Select

HL0082922 $0.16 qt.

Spartan

Bio Renew         4835 $0.078 qt.

No Bid n/a

22

Deep Blue (window 

cleaner) (EPA)
Green Select

HL0082922 $0.16 qt.

Spartan

Bio Renew         4835 $0.078 qt. No Bid n/a

21

Quat Stat Disinfectant 

(Green Seal) No Bid n/a

HDQC2               4702

GS Neutral Dis. 3513

$0.06 qt

$0.06 qt
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Bid Tabulation

Bid Commodity: Janitorial Supplies for Recreation October 20, 2011

2:30 PM

Bid Number: 8820

Item

Number Bid Description
Hillyard

Product Offered

Hillyard

Price

Royal Papers

Product Offered

Royal Papers

Price

New System 

Product Offered

New System

Price

23

Green Earth Floor 

Cleaner (EPA) Suprox $0.02 qt.

Spartan

Tri Base              4830 $0.07 qt. No Bid n/a

Betco

3500400 $0.0294 qt.

25

Deep Blue (window 

cleaner) (Hydrogen P)
Suprox

HIL0083322 $0.01 qt.

Spartan Clean by 

Peroxy             4820 $0.025 qt.

Envirox 117

Envirox Evolve O2

$0.08 qt.

$0.07 qt.

24

Quat Stat Disinfectant 

(EPA)
Vindicator

HIL0080622 $0.01 qt.

HDQC2               4702

GS Neutral Dis. 3513

$0.06 qt

$0.06 qt

Envirox 117

Envirox Evolve O2

$0.08 qt.

$0.07 qt.

27

Quat Stat Disinfectant 

(Hydrogen P)
Suprox D

HIL008222 $0.09 qt.

HDQC2

4702 $0.06 qt.

Envirox 117

Envirox Evolve O2

$0.69 qt.

$0.55 qt.

26

Green Earth Floor 

Cleaner (Hydrogen P)
Suprox

HIL0083322 $0.02 qt.

Spartan Clean by 

Peroxy             4820 $0.10 qt.

Betco Wall Mount Fast 

Draw Free

29

EPA Certified 

(Dispenser) No Bid n/a Versa Fill Free Envirox Wall Mount Free

28 Green Seal (Dispenser) Arsenal UR System Free Versa Fill Free

Envirox Wall Mount Free30

Hydrogen Peroxide 

Based (Dispenser) No Bid n/a Clean By Peroxy Free


