BID TABULATION

BID OPENING DATE: February 18, 2011

BID OPENING TIME: 2:30 p.m.

BID NUMBER: 8475

BID TITLE / DESCRIPTION: Backhoe With Extendable Boom and Attachments

PAGE__1_OF_2

SIGNATURES:
COMPANY NAME Erb Equipment Pat Kelly Equipment Fabick Cat
CITY AND STATE

X CONTACT

X PHONE

X FAX

X EMAIL

VENDOR'S SIGNATURE| X
QTY UNIT |DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL

1 ea |Option 1 - Purchase $76,111.00 $73,573.00 $76,881.00
1 ea [Option 2 - 3 year plan, Year 1 $26,530.32 No Bid $15,051.76
1 ea |[Option 2 - 3 year plan, Year 2 $26,530.32 No Bid $15,051.76
1 ea [Option 2 - 3 year plan, Year 3 $26,530.32 No Bid $15,051.76
1 ea |Option 2 - 3 year plan, Buyout $1.00 No Bid $45,641.40
1 ea |Option 2 -5 year plan, Year 1 $16,635.03 No Bid $11,381.00
1 ea [Option 2 - 5 year plan, Year 2 $16,635.03 No Bid $11,381.00
1 ea |[Option 2 -5 year plan, Year 3 $16,635.03 No Bid $11,381.00
1 ea [Option 2 - 5 year plan, Year 4 $16,635.03 No Bid $11,381.00
1 ea |[Option 2 -5 year plan, Year 5 $16,635.03 No Bid $11,381.00
1 ea |[Option 2 - 5 year plan, Buyout $1.00 No Bid $40,018.65
1 ea |Option 3 - Base Year $18,000.00 No Bid $9,400.00
1 ea [Option 3 - Optional Year 1 $18,000.00 No Bid $9,400.00
1 ea [Option 3 - Optional Year 2 $18,000.00 No Bid $9,400.00
1 ea |Option 3 - Optional Year 3 $18,000.00 No Bid $9,400.00
1 ea |Option 3 - Optional Year 4 $18,000.00 No Bid $9,400.00




BID TABULATION

BID OPENING DATE: February 18, 2011 BID NUMBER: 8475 PAGE_2 OF_2

BID OPENING TIME: 2:30 p.m.

BID TITLE / DESCRIPTION: Backhoe With Extendable Boom and Attachments

SIGNATURES:
COMPANY NAME Luby Super 580N Luby 580N Option Luby Super 580M, Current
CITY AND STATE

X CONTACT

X PHONE

X FAX

X EMAIL

VENDOR'S SIGNATURE| X X
QTY UNIT |DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL

1 ea |Option 1 - Purchase $77,900.00 $71,190.00 $57,300.00
1 ea |Option 2 - 3 year plan, Year 1 $26,485.00 $24,690.00 $19,893.00
1 ea |[Option 2 - 3 year plan, Year 2 $26,485.00 $24,690.00 $19,893.00
1 ea |Option 2 - 3 year plan, Year 3 $26,485.00 $24,690.00 $19,893.00
1 ea |Option 2 - 3 year plan, Buyout $1.00 $1.00 $1.00
1 ea |Option 2 -5 year plan, Year 1 $16,590.00 $15,400.66 $12,461.00
1 ea |Option 2 - 5 year plan, Year 2 $16,590.00 $15,400.66 $12,461.00
1 ea |[Option 2 -5 year plan, Year 3 $16,590.00 $15,400.66 $12,461.00
1 ea |Option 2 - 5 year plan, Year 4 $16,590.00 $15,400.66 $12,461.00
1 ea [Option 2 -5 year plan, Year 5 $16,590.00 $15,400.66 $12,461.00
1 ea |Option 2 -5 year plan, Buyout $1.00 $1.00 $1.00
1 ea |Option 3 - Base Year $13,800.00 $13,800.00 $13,800.00
1 ea |[Option 3 - Optional Year 1 $13,800.00 $13,800.00 $13,800.00
1 ea [Option 3 - Optional Year 2 $13,800.00 $13,800.00 $13,800.00
1 ea |Option 3 - Optional Year 3 $13,800.00 $13,800.00 $13,800.00
1 ea |Option 3 - Optional Year 4 $13,800.00 $13,800.00 $13,800.00




