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Alt 7

TOTAL

Alternate Item 6:  Recoat Exterior of Both Slides  (Lump Sum)

Alternate Item 7:  Clean & Recoat Wooden Tower Roof, Gable, & Stairs  (Lump 

Sum)   

               

The repair to the Main Platform Weathered or Water Damaged Roof and Gable 

will be limited to Cleaning and Re-Coating/Sealing of the underside of the Main 

Platform Roof, the Interior and Exterior Platform Roof Gable Fascia, and all 

exposed wood surfaces of the Tower Stairs. No removal or replacement of wood 

is expected.

TOTAL AMOUNT - Waterslide Restoration Work             

Waterslide Restoration Work 

Item 1:  Clean, Puff, Polish & Re-caulk SCS Waterslide  (Lump Sum)

Item 2:  Recoat SCS Waterslide Underwater (Lump Sum)

Item 3:  Enclosed Waterslide Interior/Exterior Work  (Lump Sum

Item 4:  Open Waterslide Interior/Exterior Work (Lump Sum)

                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                

Item 5: Pressure Wash Exterior of Both Slides (Lump Sum)

VENDOR'S SIGNATURE X

DESCRIPTION

X

X gmfischer@sliderenu.com kenny@ccistl waltbazanjr@bazanpainting.com

X George Fischer / John Rick Phillips

X 440-930-2490 314-522-9400636-947-4500 314-991-3500

SlideRenu All American Painting

X CITY AND STATE Avon Lake OH St Louis MO

CCIMW Bazan Painting

St Charles MO St Louis MO

Kenny Smith / Chris Walter Bazan

BID TABULATION

BID OPENING DATE:  December 4, 2014

BID OPENING TIME:  2:00 p.m.

BID TITLE / DESCRIPTION: Waterslide Restoration 

$1,590.00

$440.00

$7,520.00

$13,272.00

$2,510.00

$8,140.00

$5,827.00

$39,299.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$2,947.00

$12,765.00

$7,345.00

$23,057.00

$1,100.00

$2,350.00

$8,025.00

$17,750.00

$11,850.00

$32,450.00

$25,300.00

$98,825.00

$2,280.00

$1,560.00

$6,410.00

$5,196.00

$3,468.00

$16,375.00

$10,210.00

$45,499.00
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