
SIGNATURES:

COMPANY NAME

CONTACT

PHONE

FAX

EMAIL

QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

80 Ea $425.00 $34,000.00 $512.00 $40,960.00 $431.00 $34,480.00

20 Ea $445.00 $8,900.00 $610.00 $12,200.00 $536.00 $10,720.00

70 Ea $706.00 $49,420.00

30 Ea $706.00 $21,180.00

150 Ea $806.00 $120,900.00

20 Ea $739.00 $14,780.00

30 Ea $806.00 $24,180.00

50 Ea $1,047.00 $52,350.00

50 Ea $1,047.00 $52,350.00

100 Ea $1,356.00 $135,600.00

100 Ea $1,356.00 $135,600.00

50 Ea $4,340.00 $217,000.00 $5,028.00 $251,400.00 $4,256.00 $212,800.00

20 Ea $4,632.00 $92,640.00 $4,828.00 $96,560.00 $4,645.00 $92,900.00

$352,540.00 $1,007,480.00 $350,900.00

$352,540.00 $1,007,480.00 $350,900.00

8 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Slope Style, Winch Hook.

30 Cubic Yard Roll-off Container - Rectangular Style with Rollers.

Grand Total

30 Cubic Yard Roll-off Container - Tub Style with Rollers.

2 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Std. Style, Winch Hook, and with 

Casters.

Total

3 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Std. Style, Winch Hook and with 

Casters.

3 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Slpoe Style, Winch Hook and with 

Casters.

4 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Std. Style, Winch Hook and with 

Casters.

4 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Std. Style, Winch Hook and No 

Casters.

4 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Slope Style, Winch Hook and with 

Casters.

6 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Std. Syle, Winch Hook.

6 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Slope Syle, Winch Hook.

8 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Std. Style, Winch Hook.

VENDOR'S SIGNATURE X X X

DESCRIPTION

2 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Slope Style, Winch Hook, and with 

Casters.

X 660-727-1352 704-878-0734 417-589-6753

X sdunn@gregorydm.com Mjenkins@wastequip.com hgaab@sbcglobal.net

X Sonya Dunn Marya Jenkins Harry Gaab

X 660-727-1350 800-255-4126 ext. 244 314-599-2818

Gregory Container Inc. Wastequip Downing Sales & Service Inc.

CITY AND STATE Kahoka, MO Statesville, NC Phillipsburg, MO 65722

BID TABULATION

BID OPENING DATE:  October 21, 2014 BID NUMBER: 10476                                                   PAGE 1 of 2

BID OPENING TIME:  2:30 p.m.

BID TITLE / DESCRIPTION: 2, 3, 4, 6 and 8 Yard Dumpsters (Rear Load) and 30 Cubic Yard Roll-off Containers

mailto:Mjenkins@wastequip.com


SIGNATURES:

COMPANY NAME

CONTACT

PHONE

FAX

EMAIL

QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

80 Ea $565.00 $45,200.00 No Bid

20 Ea $578.00 $11,560.00

100 Ea $762.00 $76,200.00

30 Ea

180 Ea $889.00 $160,020.00

20 Ea $815.00 $16,300.00

30 Ea

100 Ea $1,163.00 $116,300.00

50 Ea

200 Ea $1,468.00 $293,600.00

100 Ea

50 Ea $4,300.00 $215,000.00
20 Ea $4,844.00 $96,880.00 No Bid

$1,031,060.00 No Bid

$1,031,060.00 No Bid

Total

Grand Total

6 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Std. Syle, Winch Hook.

6 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Slope Syle, Winch Hook.

8 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Std. Style, Winch Hook.

8 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Slope Style, Winch Hook.

30 Cubic Yard Roll-off Container - Rectangular Style with Rollers.

30 Cubic Yard Roll-off Container - Tub Style with Rollers.

2 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Std. Style, Winch Hook, and with 

Casters.

3 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Std. Style, Winch Hook and with 

Casters.

3 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Slope Style, Winch Hook and with 

Casters.

4 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Std. Style, Winch Hook and with 

Casters.
4 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Std. Style, Winch Hook and No 

Casters.

4 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Slope Style, Winch Hook and with 

Casters.

VENDOR'S SIGNATURE X X X

DESCRIPTION

2 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Slope Style, Winch Hook, and with 

Casters.

X 636-265-2273 704-588-5250

X ksaunders@kellyquip.com

X Kathleen Saunders Matt Odekirk

X 319-750-5074 800-795-6886

Kelly Equipment Otto Environmental Systems (NC), LLC

CITY AND STATE Fort Madison, IA Charlotte, NC

No Bid

BID TABULATION

BID OPENING DATE:  October 21, 2014 BID NUMBER: 10476                                                   PAGE 2 of 2

BID OPENING TIME:  2:30 p.m.

BID TITLE / DESCRIPTION: 2, 3, 4, 6 and 8 Yard Dumpsters (Rear Load) and 30 Cubic Yard Roll-off Containers

mailto:ksaunders@kellyquip.com


SIGNATURES:

COMPANY NAME

CONTACT

PHONE

FAX

EMAIL

QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

70 Ea $653.00 $45,710.00 $690.00 $48,300.00 $616.00 $43,120.00

30 Ea $673.00 $20,190.00 $690.00 $20,700.00 $616.00 $18,480.00

150 Ea $706.00 $105,900.00 $777.00 $116,550.00 $726.00 $108,900.00

20 Ea $706.00 $14,120.00 $714.00 $14,280.00 $668.00 $13,360.00

30 Ea $726.00 $21,780.00 $777.00 $23,310.00 $726.00 $21,780.00

50 Ea $896.00 $44,800.00 $983.00 $49,150.00 $936.00 $46,800.00

50 Ea $916.00 $45,800.00 $983.00 $49,150.00 $936.00 $46,800.00

100 Ea $1,231.00 $123,100.00 $1,280.00 $128,000.00 $1,156.00 $115,600.00

100 Ea $1,251.00 $125,100.00 $1,280.00 $128,000.00 $1,156.00 $115,600.00

$546,500.00 $577,440.00 $530,440.00

$546,500.00 $577,440.00 $530,440.00

Total

Grand Total

OPTIONAL BID: 6 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Std. Style, Winch Hook, 

10 Gauge Floor & 12 Gauge Walls.

OPTIONAL BID: 6 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Slope Style, Winch 

Hook, 10 Gauge Floor & 12 Gauge Walls.

OPTIONAL BID: 8 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Std. Style, Winch Hook, 

10 Gauge Floor & 12 Gauge Walls.

OPTIONAL BID: 8 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Slope Style, Winch 

Hook, 12 Gauge Floor & 12 Gauge Walls.

OPTIONAL BID: 3 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Std. Style, Winch Hook & 

with Casters, 12 Gauge Floor & 12 Gauge Sides.

OPTIONAL BID: 3 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Slope Style, Winch Hook 

& with Casters, 12 Gauge Floor & 12 Gauge Sides.

OPTIONAL BID: 4 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Std. Style, Winch Hook & 

with Casters, 12 Gauge Floor &12 Gauge Sides.

OPTIONAL BID: 4 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Std. Style, Winch Hook & 

No Casters, 12 Gauge Floor & 12 Gauge Sides.

OPTIONAL BID: 4 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Slope Style, Winch Hook 

& with Casters, 12 Gauge Floor &12 Gauge Sides.

VENDOR'S SIGNATURE X X X

DESCRIPTION

X 660-727-1352 704-878-0734 417-589-6753

X sdunn@gregorydm.com Mjenkins@wastequip.com hgaab@sbcglobal.net

X Sonya Dunn Marya Jenkins Harry Gaab

X 660-727-1350 800-255-4126 ext. 244 314-599-2818

Gregory Container Inc. Wastequip Downing Sales & Service Inc.

CITY AND STATE Kahoka, MO Statesville, NC Phillipsburg, MO 65722

BID TABULATION

BID OPENING DATE:  October 21, 2014 BID NUMBER: 10476                                                   PAGE 1 of 2

BID OPENING TIME:  2:30 p.m.

BID TITLE / DESCRIPTION: 2, 3, 4, 6 and 8 Yard Dumpsters (Rear Load) and 30 Cubic Yard Roll-off Containers - OPTIONAL BID

mailto:sdunn@gregorydm.com
mailto:hgaab@sbcglobal.net


SIGNATURES:

COMPANY NAME

CONTACT

PHONE

FAX

EMAIL

QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

100 Ea $716.00 $71,600.00

30 Ea

180 Ea $874.00 $157,320.00

20 Ea $800.00 $16,000.00

30 Ea

100 Ea $1,051.00 $105,100.00

50 Ea

200 Ea $1,347.00 $269,400.00

100 Ea

$619,420.00

$619,420.00

BID TABULATION

BID OPENING DATE:  October 21, 2014 BID NUMBER: 10476                                                   PAGE 2 of 2

BID OPENING TIME:  2:30 p.m.

BID TITLE / DESCRIPTION: 2, 3, 4, 6 and 8 Yard Dumpsters (Rear Load) and 30 Cubic Yard Roll-off Containers - OPTIONAL BID

Kelly Equipment

CITY AND STATE Fort Madison, IA

X Kathleen Saunders

X 319-750-5074

X 636-265-2273

X ksaunders@kellyquip.com

VENDOR'S SIGNATURE X X X

DESCRIPTION

OPTIONAL BID: 3 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Std. Style, Winch Hook & 

with Casters, 12 Gauge Floor & 12 Gauge Sides.

OPTIONAL BID: 3 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Slope Style, Winch Hook 

& with Casters, 12 Gauge Floor & 12 Gauge Sides.

OPTIONAL BID: 4 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Std. Style, Winch Hook & 

with Casters, 12 Gauge Floor &12 Gauge Sides.

OPTIONAL BID: 4 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Std. Style, Winch Hook & 

No Casters, 12 Gauge Floor & 12 Gauge Sides.

OPTIONAL BID: 4 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Slope Style, Winch Hook 

& with Casters, 12 Gauge Floor &12 Gauge Sides.

OPTIONAL BID: 6 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Std. Style, Winch Hook, 

10 Gauge Floor & 12 Gauge Walls.

OPTIONAL BID: 6 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Slope Style, Winch 

Hook, 10 Gauge Floor & 12 Gauge Walls.

OPTIONAL BID: 8 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Std. Style, Winch Hook, 

10 Gauge Floor & 12 Gauge Walls.

OPTIONAL BID: 8 Yard Dumpster - Rear Load, Slope Style, Winch 

Hook, 12 Gauge Floor & 12 Gauge Walls.

Total

Grand Total

mailto:ksaunders@kellyquip.com

