BID TABULATION

BID OPENING DATE: August 4, 2016

BID OPENING TIME: 2:30 p.m.

BID TITLE / DESCRIPTION: Traffic Signs and U-Channel Posts

BID NUMBER:_11647

PAGE 1 OF

SIGNATURES:
Lightle Enterprises of
COMPANY NAME Custom Product Corp. Traffic Control Company Ohio, LLC
CITY AND STATE Jackson, MS 39289 Valley Park, MO 63088 Frankfort, OH 45628
X CONTACT Alexx Smith Ron Durham David Lightle
X PHONE 888-905-5665 636-212-3666 740-998-5363
X FAX 866-656-0495 636-225-3460 740-998-5364
rond@trafficcontrolcompany. | dlightle@lightleenterprises
X EMAIL [ alex.h.smith@cpcsigns.com com .com
VENDOR'S SIGNATURE| X X X
ITEM | QTY UNIT |DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL| UNIT PRICE TOTAL | UNIT PRICE TOTAL
Post Specs. - Galv. Steel, 2 Ib/foot.
1 50 Each |10'U Channel Post $17.14 $857.00 $17.88 $894.00 $17.95 $897.50
2 50 Each |12'U Channel Post $20.56 $1,028.00 $21.42 $1,071.00 $21.50:  $1,075.00
Sign Specs. - .080 Aluminum ID blanks, no
finish, no holes, standard radius on
corners, flat bedded.
3 20 Each |6"x 24" $3.04 $60.80 $2.34 $46.80 $2.60 $52.00
4 20 Each |6"x 30" $3.79 $75.80 $2.92 $58.40 $3.25 $65.00
5 20 Each |6"x 36" $4.15 $83.00 $3.49 $69.80 $3.90 $78.00
6 20 Each |9"x 24" $4.15 $83.00 $3.49 $69.80 $3.90 $78.00
7 20 Each |9"x 30" $5.19 $103.80 $4.37 $87.40 $4.88 $97.60
8 20 Each |9"x 36" $6.15 $123.00 $5.23 $104.60 $5.85 $117.00
Sign Specs. - .080 Aluminum ID blanks, no
finish, no holes, standard radius on
corners, 2 holes top bottom centered, no
finish.
9 20 Each |6"x 12" $1.55 $31.00 $1.89 $37.80 $1.40 $28.00
10 100 Each |12"x 18" $3.84 $384.00 $2.99 $299.00 $3.90 $390.00
11 20 Each 12" x 36" $7.77 $155.40 $6.53 $130.60 $7.80 $156.00
12 50 Each |18" x 24" $7.77 $388.50 $5.99 $299.50 $7.80 $390.00
13 50 Each |24" x 24" - Square $10.36 $518.00 $8.70 $435.00 $10.40 $520.00
14 50 Each |24" x 30" $12.19 $609.50 $10.89 $544.50 $13.00 $650.00
15 50 Each |30" x 30" - Square $15.24 $762.00 $13.60 $680.00 $16.25 $812.50
15a 30 Each |30" x 30" - Octagon $14.01 $420.30 $13.60 $408.00 $15.65 $469.50
16 20 Each |30" x 36" $18.54 $370.80 $16.32 $326.40 $19.50 $390.00
17 20 Each |36 " x 36" - Square $21.94 $438.80 $19.59 $391.80 $23.40 $468.00
17a 20 Each |36" x 36" Round/Circle $20.59 $411.80 $19.59 $391.80 $23.40 $468.00
17b 20 Each |36" x 36" Octagon $20.18 $403.60 $19.59 $391.80 $22.80 $456.00
Vinyl Sign Making Film- All rolls of Vinyl
Reflective Sheeting are pressure sensitive,
36" X 50" yards, non-perforated.
18 3 Rolls |Red, 3M Electro Cut Film - 1172C $510.67 $1,532.01 $593.00 $1,779.00 $561.15! $1,683.45
19 3 Rolls |Green, 3M Electro Cut Film - 1177C $510.67 $1,532.01 $593.00 $1,779.00 $561.15:  $1,683.45
20 3 Rolls |Black, 3M Electro Cut Film - 1178 $510.67 $1,532.01 $593.00 $1,779.00 $561.15! $1,683.45
White, 3M High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting -
21 3 Rolls {3930 $675.00 $2,025.00 $787.00 $2,361.00 $675.00;  $2,025.00
Yellow, 3M High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting -
22 3 Rolls [3931 $675.00 $2,025.00 $787.00 $2,361.00 $675.00:  $2,025.00
Off White/Gray, 3M Engineering Grad
23 4 Rolls |Reflective Sheeting - 3290 $415.16 $1,660.64 $437.35 $1,749.40 $405.00i  $1,620.00
White, 3M Engineer Grade Prismatic Sheeting
24 4 Rolls |- 3430 $351.51 $1,406.04 $437.35 $1,749.40 $376.88:  $1,507.52
Orange, 3M High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting
25 4 Rolls |- 3934 $675.00 $2,700.00 $854.00 $3,416.00 $675.00i  $2,700.00
Fluorescent Yellow/Green, 3M Diamond
26 2 Rolls |Grade Sheeting - 4083/3983 $1,446.80 $2,893.60 $2,557.06 $5,114.12| $2,170.00i $4,340.00
27 20 Rolls |Transfer Tape, 48" x 100 yards $180.21 $3,604.20 $117.10 $2,342.00 $536.47! $10,729.40
28 Cutting to Length $25.00 no bid no bid no bhid no bid
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Faces - Engineer Grade - Pressure
sensitive with white background with red
border and red lettering.
12" x 18" No Parking any time with double
29 100 Each |arrow. $3.25 $325.00 $8.34 $834.00 $2.78 $278.00
12" x 18" No Parking any time with single
30 50 Each |arrow left. $3.30 $165.00 $8.34 $417.00 $2.78 $139.00
12" x 18" No Parking any time with single
31 50 Each |arrow right. $3.30 $165.00 $8.34 $417.00 $2.78 $139.00
Eagle Eye on Crime, 12" x 18", pressure
32 25 Each |sensitive - JPED file is available $3.83 $95.75 $8.34 $208.50 $2.78 $69.50
Handicap, with fines ($50, $300), 12" x 18",
33 25 Each |pressure sensitive. $3.83 $95.75 $8.34 $208.50 $2.78 $69.50
12" x 18" 2 hr Parking, 8am - 7pm, except
34 50 Each |Sundays and holidays. $3.30 $165.00 $8.34 $417.00 $2.78 $139.00
Hardware
Brackets - for mounting flat blade at right
angle to post, includes two set screws and tow
35 100 Each |5/16 hex head bolts. Bracket length 5-1/2". $4.40 $440.00 $3.55 $355.00 $3.20 $320.00
36 500 Each |One way bold - 5/16" x 2", theft proof. $0.35 $175.00 $0.79 $395.00 $0.60 $300.00
37 500 Each |Breakaway nut $0.60 $300.00 $0.79 $395.00 $0.60 $300.00
Button Delineator - 18" x 18", 9 button, .080
aluminum, red on red (red background, red
38 20 Each |[reflectors) $21.65 $433.00 $26.10 $522.00 $22.50 $450.00
Adjustable Band Brackets with Snap Lock
Assembly - 1/2" x 38" strap length, stainless
39 100 Each |steel. $8.66 $866.00 $5.40 $540.00 $3.70 $370.00
Jumbo Brakets- 11 3/4" long with 3 holes to
hold street name plate in Super Lock, Cast
Aluminum; equal to Super Lock or equivalent
40 100 Each |is acceptable. $9.95 $995.00 - - $18.90f  $1,890.00
Ultra Bracket, 5-1/2" long to hold street name
plate in Super Lock, Cast Aluminum; equal to
41 50 Each |Super Lock or equivalent item is acceptable. $3.75 $187.50 - - $10.60 $530.00
Plus 4 Sign Bracket, Band-it Bracket for posts
42 50 Each [over 4" in diameter, Cast Aluminum $1.14 $57.00 - - $1.40 $70.00
Square Posts
43 30 Each |Upright Post, 12' - 14 Gauge 2.00" $32.27 $968.10 $25.02 $750.60 $30.15 $904.50
44 30 Each |Upright Post, 12" - 14 Gauge 1.75" $29.19 $875.70 $26.10 $783.00 $27.15 $814.50
15 days; out of stock posts
Provide Delivery ARO: up to 75 days 7-10 days 30-45 days
Total

Notes

#26 price is for 3983, price
for 4083 is $1,850.47.

Square Posts # 43 and
#44 are Galvanized Steel




BID TABULATION

BID OPENING DATE: August 4, 2016

BID OPENING TIME: 2:30 p.m.

BID TITLE / DESCRIPTION: Traffic Signs and U-Channel Posts

BID NUMBER:_11647
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SIGNATURES:
COMPANY NAME| Osburn Associates, Inc. Vulcan Signs Hall Signs
CITY AND STATE Logan, OH 43139 Foley, AL 36536 Bloomington, IN
X CONTACT Jennifer David Beviacqua Jenni Kalbfleisch
X PHONE 800-523-8917 800-633-6845 800-284-7446
X FAX 740-385-8016 251-943-1541 812-332-9816
X EMAIL| jennifert@osburns.com vulcan3@vulcaninc.com bids@hallsigns.com
VENDOR'S SIGNATURE| X X X
ITEM | QTY UNIT |DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL| UNIT PRICE TOTAL | UNIT PRICE TOTAL
Post Specs. - Galv. Steel, 2 Ib/foot.
1 50 Each [10' U Channel Post $17.92 $896.00
2 50 Each |[12'U Channel Post $21.54 $1,077.00
Sign Specs. - .080 Aluminum ID blanks, no
finish, no holes, standard radius on
corners, flat bedded.
3 20 Each |6" x 24" $2.14 $42.80
4 20 Each |6" x 30" $2.68 $53.60
5 20 Each |6" x 36" $3.21 $64.20
6 20 Each |9"x 24" $3.21 $64.20
7 20 Each [9" x 30" $4.01 $80.20
8 20 Each |9" x 36" $4.82 $96.40
Sign Specs. - .080 Aluminum ID blanks, no
finish, no holes, standard radius on
corners, 2 holes top bottom centered, no
finish.
9 20 Each |6"x 12" $1.07 $21.40
10 100 Each [12"x 18" $3.21 $321.00
11 20 Each [12"x 36" $6.42 $128.40
12 50 Each [18"x 24" $6.42 $321.00
13 50 Each |24" x 24" - Square $8.56 $428.00
14 50 Each [24" x 30" $10.70 $535.00
15 50 Each |30" x 30" - Square $13.38 $669.00
15a 30 Each |30" x 30" - Octagon $13.38 $401.40
16 20 Each |30" x 36" $16.05 $321.00
17 20 Each |36 " x 36" - Square $19.26 $385.20
17a 20 Each |36" x 36" Round/Circle $19.26 $385.20
17b 20 Each |36" x 36" Octagon $19.26 $385.20
Vinyl Sign Making Film- All rolls of Vinyl
Reflective Sheeting are pressure sensitive,
36" X 50" yards, non-perforated.
18 3 Rolls |Red, 3M Electro Cut Film - 1172C $454.50 $1,363.50
19 3 Rolls |Green, 3M Electro Cut Film - 1177C $454.50 $1,363.50
20 3 Rolls |Black, 3M Electro Cut Film - 1178 $454.50 $1,363.50
White, 3M High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting -
21 3 Rolls 3930 $567.00 $1,701.00
Yellow, 3M High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting -
22 3 Rolls 3931 $567.00 $1,701.00
Off White/Gray, 3M Engineering Grad
23 4 Rolls [Reflective Sheeting - 3290 $360.00 $1,440.00
White, 3M Engineer Grade Prismatic Sheeting
24 4 Rolls |- 3430 $306.00 $1,224.00
Orange, 3M High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting
25 4 Rolls |- 3934 $567.00 $2,268.00
Fluorescent Yellow/Green, 3M Diamond
26 2 Rolls |Grade Sheeting - 4083/3983 $1,341.00 $2,682.00
27 20 Rolls |Transfer Tape, 48" x 100 yards $408.00 $8,160.00
28 Cutting to Length no bid no bid
Faces - Engineer Grade - Pressure
sensitive with white background with red
border and red lettering.
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12" x 18" No Parking any time with double

29 100 Each [arrow. $2.22 $222.00
12" x 18" No Parking any time with single

30 50 Each [arrow left. $2.22 $111.00
12" x 18" No Parking any time with single

31 50 Each |arrow right. $2.22 $111.00
Eagle Eye on Crime, 12" x 18", pressure

32 25 Each [sensitive - JPED file is available $2.22 $55.50
Handicap, with fines ($50, $300), 12" x 18",

33 25 Each |pressure sensitive. $2.22 $55.50
12" x 18" 2 hr Parking, 8am - 7pm, except

34 50 Each |Sundays and holidays. $2.22 $111.00
Hardware
Brackets - for mounting flat blade at right
angle to post, includes two set screws and tow

35 100 Each |5/16 hex head bolts. Bracket length 5-1/2". $9.48 $948.00

36 500 Each |One way bold - 5/16" x 2", theft proof. $0.78 $390.00

37 500 Each |Breakaway nut $0.78 $390.00
Button Delineator - 18" x 18", 9 button, .080
aluminum, red on red (red background, red

38 20 Each |[reflectors) $42.56 $851.20
Adjustable Band Brackets with Snap Lock
Assembly - 1/2" x 38" strap length, stainless

39 100 Each |steel. $1.48 $148.00
Jumbo Brakets- 11 3/4" long with 3 holes to
hold street name plate in Super Lock, Cast
Aluminum; equal to Super Lock or equivalent

40 100 Each |is acceptable. $6.75 $675.00
Ultra Bracket, 5-1/2" long to hold street name
plate in Super Lock, Cast Aluminum; equal to

41 50 Each |Super Lock or equivalent item is acceptable. $3.75 $187.50
Plus 4 Sign Bracket, Band-it Bracket for posts

42 50 Each |over 4" in diameter, Cast Aluminum $1.58 $79.00
Square Posts

43 30 Each |Upright Post, 12' - 14 Gauge 2.00" $26.54 $796.20

44 30 Each [Upright Post, 12" - 14 Gauge 1.75" $22.85 $685.50

Provide Delivery ARO:| 30 days & posts 45 days
Total

Notes

#26 - price for 3983 only.
#28 - Varies per product.

Not Accepted. Did not
submit Revised Bid
Proposal.

Not Accepted. Did not
submit Revised Bid
Proposal.




BID TABULATION

BID OPENING DATE: August 4, 2016

BID OPENING TIME: 2:30 p.m.

BID TITLE / DESCRIPTION: Traffic Signs and U-Channel Posts

BID NUMBER:_11647
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SIGNATURES:
Traffic Parking & Control
COMPANY NAME| Road Runner Safety Svcs. (TAPCO) MD Solutions
CITY AND STATE| Cape Girardeau, MO 63701 Brown Deer, WI 53223 Plain City, OH 43064
X CONTACT Bryan Brown Bekah Lee Neil Levy
X PHONE 573-204-0060 260-814-7314 614-875-2222
X FAX 573-204-7166 260-649-5143 614-873-2220
X EMAIL| dave@roadrunnerss.com bekah@tapconet.com neil@md-signs.com
VENDOR'S SIGNATURE| X X X
ITEM | QTY UNIT |DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL| UNIT PRICE TOTAL | UNIT PRICE TOTAL
Post Specs. - Galv. Steel, 2 Ib/foot.
1 50 Each |10' U Channel Post
2 50 Each |12'U Channel Post
Sign Specs. - .080 Aluminum ID blanks, no
finish, no holes, standard radius on
corners, flat bedded.
3 20 Each |6"x 24"
4 20 Each |6"x 30"
5 20 Each |6"x 36"
6 20 Each |9"x 24"
7 20 Each 9" x 30"
8 20 Each 9" x 36"
Sign Specs. - .080 Aluminum ID blanks, no
finish, no holes, standard radius on
corners, 2 holes top bottom centered, no
finish.
9 20 Each |6"x 12"
10 100 Each [12"x 18"
11 20 Each 12" x 36"
12 50 Each [18"x 24"
13 50 Each |24" x 24" - Square
14 50 Each |24" x 30"
15 50 Each |30" x 30" - Square
15a 30 Each |30" x 30" - Octagon
16 20 Each |30" x 36"
17 20 Each |36 " x 36" - Square
17a 20 Each |36" x 36" Round/Circle
17b 20 Each |36" x 36" Octagon
Vinyl Sign Making Film- All rolls of Vinyl
Reflective Sheeting are pressure sensitive,
36" X 50" yards, non-perforated.
18 3 Rolls |Red, 3M Electro Cut Film - 1172C
19 3 Rolls |Green, 3M Electro Cut Film - 1177C
20 3 Rolls |Black, 3M Electro Cut Film - 1178
White, 3M High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting -
21 3 Rolls {3930
Yellow, 3M High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting -
22 3 Rolls [3931
Off White/Gray, 3M Engineering Grad
23 4 Rolls [Reflective Sheeting - 3290
White, 3M Engineer Grade Prismatic Sheeting
24 4 Rolls |- 3430
Orange, 3M High Intensity Prismatic Sheeting
25 4 Rolls |- 3934
Fluorescent Yellow/Green, 3M Diamond
26 2 Rolls [Grade Sheeting - 4083/3983
27 20 Rolls |Transfer Tape, 48" x 100 yards
28 Cutting to Length
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Faces - Engineer Grade - Pressure
sensitive with white background with red
border and red lettering.

12" x 18" No Parking any time with double

29 100 Each |arrow.
12" x 18" No Parking any time with single
30 50 Each |arrow left.
12" x 18" No Parking any time with single
31 50 Each |arrow right.
Eagle Eye on Crime, 12" x 18", pressure
32 25 Each |sensitive - JPED file is available
Handicap, with fines ($50, $300), 12" x 18",
33 25 Each |pressure sensitive.
12" x 18" 2 hr Parking, 8am - 7pm, except
34 50 Each |Sundays and holidays.
Hardware
Brackets - for mounting flat blade at right
angle to post, includes two set screws and tow
35 100 Each |5/16 hex head bolts. Bracket length 5-1/2".
36 500 Each |One way bold - 5/16" x 2", theft proof.
37 500 Each |Breakaway nut
Button Delineator - 18" x 18", 9 button, .080
aluminum, red on red (red background, red
38 20 Each |reflectors)
Adjustable Band Brackets with Snap Lock
Assembly - 1/2" x 38" strap length, stainless
39 100 Each |steel.
Jumbo Brakets- 11 3/4" long with 3 holes to
hold street name plate in Super Lock, Cast
Aluminum; equal to Super Lock or equivalent
40 100 Each |is acceptable.
Ultra Bracket, 5-1/2" long to hold street name
plate in Super Lock, Cast Aluminum; equal to
41 50 Each |Super Lock or equivalent item is acceptable.
Plus 4 Sign Bracket, Band-it Bracket for posts
42 50 Each |over 4" in diameter, Cast Aluminum
Square Posts
43 30 Each |Upright Post, 12' - 14 Gauge 2.00"
44 30 Each |Upright Post, 12" - 14 Gauge 1.75"

Provide Delivery ARO:

Total

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Notes

Not Accepted. Did not
submit Revised Bid
Proposal.

Not Accepted. Did not
submit Revised Bid
Proposal.

Not Accepted. Did not
submit Revised Bid
Proposal.




